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210x148x2 mm. This item is printed on demand - Print on
Demand Neuware - Scholarly Essay from the year 2011 in the
subject Business economics - Personnel and Organisation,
grade: A, Union Graduate College, course: Managing People and
Teams in Organizations, language: English, abstract: Every year,
the business magazine Fortune publishes its list of the 100 Best
Companies To Work For®. For this purpose Fortune partners with
the global research consulting firm Great Place to Work
Institute® to conduct the 'most extensive employee survey in
corporate America' [1] with 407 participating companies this
year. Only companies that are more than seven years old and
have at least 1,000 employees are eligible. A company's score in
this ranking is based on two factors. One is a 57-question survey
sent to a minimum of 400 randomly selected employees, asking
for things like attitudes towards the management and job
satisfaction. This survey accounts for two thirds of the score. The
other third is based on a Culture Audit, capturing detailed
demographics, pay and benefit programs, management
philosophy, methods of internal communications, opportunities
as well as compensation and diversity issues [1]. When looking at
the...
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